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Mandatory Spay/Neuter law expanded to cover the 

Spears clan Los Angeles 
Jay Joseph reporting:  
 
In a press conference to explain the recent admission of Britney Spears to a Los Angeles area 
hospital, Mayor Antonio Villaragosa announced that the recently passed mandatory spay/neuter 
law for all dogs and cats in Los Angeles City had been expanded to cover the Spears family. All 
members of the Spears Clan will be required to be spayed or neutered by the age of 4 years to 
prevent the overcrowding of county orphanages. The Mayor stood together with Edwina Boks, 
the Chief Administrator of the city orphanages, in City Hall to announce that there has been a 
recent spike in the population of city orphanages and that the Spears family reproduction rate has 
been a major contributor to this crisis. "Britney has been the largest contributor so far, so she will 
be the first to be subjected to the new mandate" said the Mayor. Jamie Lynn will be next in line 
after the birth of her child and the children will be monitored carefully until they are four years 
old to be sure that they do not reproduce before they are neutered. Ms. Boks indicated that the 
fathers of  the children may be considered for neutering under the new law and city attornies are 
trying determining the paternity of Jamie Lynn's baby to help prevent further breeding.  
 
Lynn and James Spears are being fined $1 million for not obtaining the proper breeder permits for 
producing the Spears girls in the first place. Unfortunately, the Spears reside in a state known for 
harboring and encouraging baby mills so collecting the fine may be difficult. It is estimated that 
the City spends over $50 million a year in housing and care for orphans and that placement of 
children produced by spoiled celebrities is particularly difficult because of their poor socialization 
and overall aggressive behavior. According to Ms Boks many of these children are ultimately 
deemed "un-placeable" and need to be transferred directly into the prison system for housing after 
they turn 18 years of age. Renowned child behaviorist Cesar Milan says that early spay/neuter has 
been show to quell their poor behavior and make them much more able to be integrated into 
society. Ms Boks admits that the closure of Neverland Ranch (Michael Jackson's rehabilitation 
facility for wayward celebrity children) was a great loss to the city orphanage system and the 
output of the Spears girls has just exacerbated the strain despite millions spent on new facilities in 
recent years. "This is a logical step to help get control of the problem and gives us a new tool in 
our efforts to provide the best for the young children of spoiled celebrities", added the Mayor.  
 
There are exemptions for "Show Children", those who have preformed in an approved TV or 
Movie production (Direct to DVD will not count) or produced a Grammy winning album within 
the last year and continue to have viable careers beyond that. Also children that have forsaken the 
celebrity life, and have chosen meaningful careers in law enforcement or other service related 
occupations will be exempt. Celebrities may obtain a breeders permit and be allowed to have one 
child if they are members of an approved registering agency such as the Screen Actors Guild. 
Children who are too ill for the procedure and obtain a letter from a board certified physician 
(plastic surgeons will not qualify) may also be exempt, but must be re-certified every six months 
until they healthy enough to undergo the procedure, or have met one of the other exemptions. 
Judy Mancuso, director of the Coalition for Healthy Celebrities, hailed this as a victory for all tax 
paying, law abiding citizens of Los Angeles and hopes to take this law to the many other areas 
with celebrity overpopulation problems in the near future to ultimately stem the tide of greedy 
celebrity breeders and save millions of tax payer dollars.   


